
Typical Characteristics

To gain maximum benefit from ANYWAY range, 
systems should be flushed, and filters changed, 
before the new oil is introduced. 

This is particularly important whenever problems 
of precipitation (solid deposits) have been 
experienced.

. Good load-carrying properties

. Good anti-wear characteristics

. Excellent for anti-stick-slip properties

. Good adhesion

. Excellent corrosion protection

. Possess the necessary anti-foam and air 

.......release properties

ANYWAY grades are based on solvent-refined  
oils, and they contain additives that give closely
controlled frictional characteristics in machine
tool sliding conditions. 
Other additives enhance film-strength, anti-wear 
properties, adhesion and anti-corrosion 
characteristics, and minimize foaming in 
reservoirs. 
The many grades in the range are of different  
viscosities but have the same additive content.
This wide requirements of most machine tools.

ANYWAY grades are recommended for the 
lubrication of all types of multiways, both linear 
and rotational. 
They are suitable for both horizontal and vertical 
ways, and for roller-type systems. 
These oils can be used also for the table -
elevating  slideways on milling machines, lead-
screw-and-nut-systems, gears of feed 
mechanisms, oil-lubricated milling heads  and  
lather slides.

ANYWAY 
Multi Way Lubricants

The above figures are typical of those obtained with normal production
tolerances and do not constitute a specification.
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